Solid Waste Collection - 6/30/2020 1400 hrs.

Recycling Collection - 6/30/2020 1415 hrs.

Vegetative Waste Collection - 6/30/2020 1430 hrs.

SOLID WASTE Option 1 (2x/week) Option 2 (1x/week) Alt. Bid - School District

Blue Diamond

Year 1

Year 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Year 3

Year 4

Year 5

TOTAL

Gaeta

Year 1 $477,600.00 $516,000.00 $39,600.00
Year 2 $493,200.00 $528,000.00 $40,800.00
Year 3 $507,600.00 $540,000.00 $42,000.00
Year 4 $517,200.00 $552,000.00 $43,200.00
Year 5 $529,200.00 $564,000.00 $44,400.00
TOTAL $2,524,800.00 $2,700,000.00 $210,000.00




RECYCLING Option 1 (dual stream) Option 1A (dual stream) Option 2 (Single Stream Alt. Bid - School District

Blue Diamond

Year 1 $480,000.00 $282,000.00 $336,000.00

Year 2 $492,000.00 $291,000.00 $348,000.00 | NO BID

Year 3 $504,000.00 $300,000.00 $360,000.00

Year 4 $516,000.00 $309,000.00 $372,000.00

Year 5 $528,000.00 $318,000.00 $384,000.00

TOTAL $2,520,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,800,000.00

Gaeta

Year 1 $210,000.00 $193,000.00 $280,000.00 $8,001.00
Year 2 $216,000.00 $199,000.00 $290,000.00 $8,300.00
Year 3 $225,000.00 $205,000.00 $300,000.00 $8,400.00
Year 4 $235,000.00 $212,000.00 $305,000.00 $8,600.00
Year 5 $240,000.00 $218,000.00 $310,000.00 $8,800.00
TOTAL $1,126,000.00 $1,027,000.00 $1,485,000.00 $42,200.00
VEG WASTE Option 1 (Collection) Option 2 (Collection & Disp of Twsp)

Blue Diamond

Year 1 $273,000.00

Year 2 $285,000.00 |NO BID

Year 3 $285,000.00

Year 4 $297,000.00

Year 5 $303,000.00

TOTAL $1,443,000.00

Gaeta

Year 1

Year 2 NO BID NO BID

Year 3

Year 4

Year 5

TOTAL




